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He remembers Buffett as keeping the event from being "too somber" and "too self-congratulatory." Buffett set the ball rolling by talking 
about philanthropy, describing the meeting as "exploratory," and then asking each person, going around the table, to describe his or her 
philosophy of giving and how it had evolved. 

The result was 12 stories, each taking around 15 minutes, for a total of nearly three hours. But most participants whom Fortune has talked 
to found the stories riveting, even when they were familiar. David Rockefeller Sr. described learning philanthropy at the knees of his father 
and grandfather. Ted Turner repeated the oft-told tale of how he had made a spur-of-the-moment decision to give $1 billion to the United 
Nations. Some people talked about the emotional difficulty of making the leap from small giving to large. Others worried that their robust 
philanthropy might alienate their children. (Later, recalling the meeting, Buffett laughed that it had made him feel like a psychiatrist.) 

The charitable causes discussed in those stories covered the spectrum: education, again and again; culture; hospitals and health; the 
environment; public policy; the poor generally. Bill Gates, who found the whole event "amazing," regarded the range of causes as 
admirable: "The diversity of American giving," he says, "is part of its beauty." 

At the dinner that followed, the conversation turned specifically to how giving by the rich could be increased. The ideas advanced included 
national recognition of great philanthropists (presidential medals, for example), or a film, or a philanthropy guidebook, or a conference of 
the rich. There was no talk of a pledge. Of the dinner, the junior Rockefeller says, "The most important thing my dad and I came away with 
was that increasing giving would take work by many in that room -- delicate, and probably prolonged, one-on-one work." 

The dinner, of course, had its unexpected coda: the leak. The leaker, with little doubt, was Chuck Feeney, and the leakee was his longtime 
friend Niall O'Dowd, the New York publisher behind the grandly unknown IrishCentral.com. (Fortune did not succeed in reaching Feeney; 
of our account, O'Dowd said, "I can't confirm that.") On May 18, two weeks after the meeting, IrishCentral.com posted an article of 14 
short paragraphs headlined "Secret meeting of world's richest people held in New York."With that, the fame of the website spiked, as the 
rest of the press picked up the news and ran with it. 

The IrishCentral article exhibited some confusion about which Rockefeller starred at the dinner, or was even there, but otherwise provided 
the names of all the participants -- with the notable exception of Feeney, who apparently didn't realize he looked more conspicuous to the 
others by being left out. Feeney, however, appears to have been quoted anonymously in the piece, once as an "attendee" who thought 
Gates the most impressive speaker of the day, Turner the most outspoken (surprise!), and Buffett the most insistent on his agenda for 
change. In a second instance, Feeney was a good bet to have been the awed "participant" who extolled his fellow guests: "They were all 
there, the great and the good." 

The main effect of the leak was to place a "cone of silence" -- that's a description from the Gates camp -- over everything that transpired 
in the giving campaign over the next year. But there was certainly action, including a few small dinners abroad. Bill and Melinda Gates 
hosted a dinner in London, and Bill held a few others in India and China. Raising the philanthropic bar in foreign countries is a special 
challenge: Dynastic wealth is widely taken for granted; tax laws do not commonly allow deductions for gifts to charity; a paucity of 
institutions and organizations ready for gifts makes knowing whom to give to just not that obvious. Nonetheless, were the Gateses and 
Buffett to succeed in their campaign in the U.S., they would probably take it overseas. 

But as last summer and fall progressed, Buffett and the Gateses did not even have a plan for how the campaign was to be structured. In 
this vacuum the idea of a pledge took hold and gained strength. It helped that more dinners were to be held. At them, says Melinda, the 
three principals would "float the pledge idea to see if it would fly." 

Letter from Rockefeller, Gates, and Buffet:  

View this document on Scribd 

There then occurred the second and third U.S. dinners, most of whose guests have not been publicly outed because of the cone of 
silence. Secrecy, a Gates spokesman says, is partly a bow to moguls who have been exposed to the philanthropic sales pitch but would be 
embarrassed to have been identified in case they chose not to step up to the challenge. 

In any event, the names of some of the participants are known. The noted philanthropists at the second dinner, held at the New York 
Public Library in November last year, included New York investment banker Kenneth Langone and his wife, Elaine, and H.F. "Gerry" 
Lenfest and his wife, Marguerite, from Philadelphia. Lenfest got rich when he sold his Pennsylvania cable television company to Comcast 
(CMCSA) in 2000, netting $1.2 billion for himself and his family. He promptly vowed that he would give most of it to charity in his 
lifetime. Now 80, he has so far meted out $800 million, a good part of it to schools he attended (Columbia Law School, Washington and 
Lee, Mercersburg Academy). 

Lenfest's favorite moment at the November dinner was Buffett's declaration that Marguerite Lenfest had put forward the best idea of the 
evening when she said that the rich should sit down, decide how much money they and their progeny need, and figure out what to do with 
the rest of it. Says Lenfest: "The value of Buffett and Gates is that they're going to make people sit down and think these things through." 



Page 5 of 5 
 

The Third Supper, held in December in Menlo Park, Calif., at the Rosewood Sand Hill hotel, is known as the Bay Area dinner but drew 
from all over the state, including its entertainment precincts. In attendance were some veteran philanthropists, including venture capitalist 
John Doerr of Kleiner Perkins and his wife, Ann, and the Morgridges, who had selected the meeting site. This dinner was somewhat 
different from the other two, says Melinda Gates, because a few people there were relatively new to huge wealth and were still forming 
their opinions about giving. Talk went on for hours, so long that the beef being prepared for dinner became somewhat overcooked. This is 
reported to have dismayed Rosewood's management, which may have noticed that the crowd in the Dogwood room was worth having 
back. 

The dinner also brought out some of the fears that people have about philanthropy. What does going public with big gifts do to the peace 
in your life? Won't pleas from charities be unending? How do you deal with giving internationally, which too often seems like throwing 
money down a hole? These are valid concerns, say the Gateses, the kind raised by people who want to feel as smart about giving as they 
were about making their money. But the questions didn't stop the two from plugging the satisfactions of philanthropy. At those dinners, 
says Bill, "no one ever said to me, 'We gave more than we should have.'" 

Nor did the idea of a pledge get shot down at those dinners. It "floated" nicely, in other words. So as 2010 arrived, a pledge became the 
strategy. The idea of aiming for a 50% slice of net worth was pragmatically pulled from the sky, being less than the principals would have 
liked to ask for but perhaps as much, at least initially, as they can get. The pledges, meanwhile, were never envisioned as legal contracts but 
rather moral obligations to be both memorialized in writing and taken very seriously. They are in fact to be posted on a new website, 
givingpledge.org, whose construction Melinda Gates oversaw. The 99% pledge that Buffett is making is likely to be the No. 1 document on 
the website, if he is not beaten out by his Seattle friends. 

Enthusiastic about leading the search for Great Givers, the Gateses and Buffett nonetheless have wanted a phalanx of strong supporters. 
Already committed to at least a 50% pledge are the Broads, the Doerrs, the Lenfests, and the Morgridges. With the online publication of 
this article, moreover, the three principals will send e-mails and make calls to other billionaires judged likely prospects. A bit later, all of the 
pledgers may join in sending a letter to a large number of other billionaires, asking them to join the growing crowd. In the fall there may 
even be a Great Givers conference. 

The definition of success in this venture may take years to figure out, but each of the principals has reflections about the matter. Buffett 
knows that everyone rich has thought about what to do with his or her money: "They may not have reached a decision about that, but they 
have for sure thought about it. The pledge that we're asking them to make will put them to thinking about the whole issue again." He 
warns, most of all, against the rich delaying the decision of what to do with their money: "If they wait until they're making a final will in 
their nineties, the chance of their brainpower and willpower being better than they are today is nil." 

Bill Gates regards the 50% as a "low bar" encouraging high participation. People, he thinks, may be drawn in by that proportion and then 
surprise themselves and find they are giving at higher levels. "This is about moving to a different realm," he thinks, and it will take time for 
everything to sort out. 

Melinda Gates separates the near-term from the far. There are so many reasons that rich people don't give, she says: They don't want to 
plan for their death; they worry that they'll need to hire someone to help with the work; they just don't want to take the time to think about 
it all. So the initial goal of the pledge campaign, she thinks, must be simply to cut through that and get them moving in the direction of 
giving. And eventually? "Three to five years down the road, we need to have a significant number of billionaires signed up. That would be 
success." 

Society cannot help but be a beneficiary here, by virtue of at least some dollars and perhaps many. Nor will it be just the very rich who will 
perhaps bend their minds to what a pledge of this kind means. It could also be others with less to give but suddenly more reason to think 
about the rightness of what they do.  

 

END OF DOCUMENT 

Question: If you were a billionaire how much of your wealth would you give away to charity, IF ANY? (It is always easy to criticize the rich.) 

 


